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DEPARTMENT OF RESOURCE MANAGEMENT 

COURTESY NOTICE 

 SOLANO AIRPORT LAND USE COMMISSION 
________________________________________________________ 

NOTICE IS GIVEN that the Solano County Airport Land Use Commission will hold a public hearing to receive a 
presentation regarding proposed minor amendments to the Travis AFB (TAFB) and Rio Vista Land Use Compatibility Plans 
(LUCP).   

Travis AFB LUCP: 
The proposed amendments to the TAFB LUCP include the addition of the Low Altitude Maneuvering Zone (LAMZ); 
guidance regarding wildlife hazards; clarification regarding the inclusion of second or accessory dwelling units when 
calculating residential densities; and other minor amendments. 

Rio Vista Airport LUCP: 
The proposed amendments include adding Section 4.8 Safety Zone 7 in the Detailed Discussion Section which was 
omitted from the 2018 update, guidance regarding wildlife hazards, deed notice requirements, revising Figure 3 Rio Vista 
Airport Influence Area to show the TAFB Compatibility Zones and Assault Landing Training Overlay Zone (ALZ) and other 
minor amendments. 

The Airport Land Use Commission will receive public comments on the proposed amendments; however, will not be taking 
action on these items.  The Public Draft documents for both plans are available for public review at  

https://www.solanocounty.com/depts/rm/boardscommissions/solano_county_airport_land_use_commission/default.asp 

The hearing will be held on Thursday, July 11 at 7:00 p.m. in the Board of Supervisors Chambers, County Administration 
Center, 1st Floor, 675 Texas Street, Fairfield, California. 

The County of Solano does not discriminate against persons with disabilities.  If you wish to participate in this meeting and 
you will require assistance in order to do so, please contact the Department of Resource Management at 707-784-6765 at 
least 24 hours in advance of the event to make reasonable arrangements to ensure accessibility to this meeting. 

PUBLIC COMMENTS: 
In-Person: You may attend the public hearing at the time and location listed above and provide comments during the public 
speaking period. Phone: You may provide comments verbally from your phone by dialing 1-415-655-0001 and entering 
Access Code 2459 165 5397  Once entered in the meeting, you will be able to hear the meeting and will be called upon to 
speak during the public speaking period. Email/Mail: Written comments can be emailed to 
SolanoALUC@SolanoCounty.com or mailed to Resource Management, Airport Land Use Commission, 675 Texas Street, 
Suite 5500, Fairfield, CA 94533, and must be received by 10:00 a.m. the day of the meeting.  Copies of written comments 
received will be provided to the Solano Airport Land Use Commission and will become a part of the official record but will 
not be read aloud at the meeting. 

Staff reports and associated materials will be available to the public approximately one week before the meeting at 
www.solanocounty.com under Departments; Resource Management; Boards, Commissions & Special Districts; Solano 
County Airport Land Use Commission.   

If you challenge the proposed consideration in court, you may be limited to raising only those issues you or someone else 
raised at the public hearing described in this notice, or in written correspondence delivered to the Solano Airport Land Use 
Commission at, or before, the public hearing. 
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